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QUESTION 1

You have implemented a Commerce Constraint rule, which has an Advanced action. While testing, you 

find that the attribute values specified in the rule are not being constrained, even though the condition is 

always true. 

What are two reasons for this behavior? (Choose two.) 

A. The attribute is used as a condition for a Commerce Hiding rule. 

B. Configuration was not deployed after the rule was implemented. 

C. Commerce was not deployed after the rule was implemented. 

D. The rule is inactive 

Correct Answer: CD 

 

QUESTION 2

Your customer wants to create a user that has complete access to the site and has the ability to add and 

edit new users. 

Which procedure should you follow to accomplish this? 

A. Click the Add button on the User Administration List page; enter values for the required fields (Login, Password,
Email, First Name, Last Name, and Phone Number); set the Type field to Admin; click the Add button to add the user to
the system; click the new user\\'s name on the User Administration List page to edit the user; select the Add New Users
check box; and click the Add button to save the changes. 

B. Click the Add button on the User Administration List page; enter values for the required fields (Login, Email, and First
Name); click the Add button to add the user to the system; click the new user\\'s name on the User Administration List
page to edit the user; select the Create/Modify Users check box; and click the Update button to save the changes. 

C. Click the Add button on the User Administration List page; enter values for the required fields (Login, Email, and First
Name); set the Type field to FullAccess; select the Create/Modify Users check box, and click the Add button to add the
user to the system. 

D. Click the Add button on the User Administration List page, set the Type field to Admin, click the Add button to add the
user to the system, click the new user\\'s name on the User Administration List page to edit the user, select the
Create/Modify Users check box, and click the Update button to save the changes. 

E. Click the Add button on the User Administration List page; enter values for the required fields (Login, Email, and First
Name); set the Type field to FullAccess; click the Add button to add the user to the system; click the new user\\'s name
on the User Administration List page to edit the user, select the Create/Modify Users check box; and click the Update
button to save the changes. 

Correct Answer: C 
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QUESTION 3

When configuration a product, which pricing is applied last on a given item (part) after it is added to a valid
configuration? 

A. Attribute value pricing 

B. List price from the PriceBook 

C. Base Price from the parts database 

D. Recommend Item Pricing 

Correct Answer: D 

 

QUESTION 4

How do you modify a specific user\\'s access (grant access or remove access) to Product Families, Supported Product
Families, and Data Table folders? 

A. For each Product Family or Data table folder affected, click the Modify tab for that item and then select or deselect
the check boxes related to the users you want to grant access to or remove access from for this Product Family or Data
Table folder. 

B. Click the user\\'s name on the User Administration List page to edit the user, click the Access Permission tab, select
or deselect the check boxes related to the items you want to grant access to or remove access from for this user. 

C. Click the Group name on the Group Administration List page that has this user as a member, click the Access
Permissions tab, select or deselect the check boxes related to the items you want to grant access to or remove access
from for this user. 

D. Go to the Product Family definition or the Data Table folder properties for which you want to grant or remove access,
click the Access Permissions tab, select or deselect the check boxes related to the users you want to grant access to or
remove access from for this Product Family or Data Table folder. 

E. Use the Navigation Menus item on the Administration home page to grant or remove access to specific Product
Families or Data Table folders for the user. 

Correct Answer: C 

 

QUESTION 5

You are asked to design a Document Designer template, which should generate an output document where users would
be able to navigate to a specific section from the table of contents. This is a complex document with many sections and
subsections that can go up to seven levels of parent/child relationships. Which three steps do you need to perform to
ensure that the table of contents show only two levels of the sections and subsections so that the user reviewing the
document can navigate to a desired section\\'s page and scroll further to the deeper levels? (Choose three.) 

A. Enable the Table of Contents option for selected heading styles. 

B. Enable the Table of Contents option for all heading styles. 

C. Assign a heading style set to the Table of Contents layout. 
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D. Create headings by using the Heading element for the section content in your template. 

E. Assign page numbers to all heading elements. 

Correct Answer: BDE 
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