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QUESTION 1

You need to recommend changes to the DNS environment that support the implementation of the sales.contoso.com
domain. The solution must ensure that the users in all of the domains can resolve both Internet names and the names of
the servers in all of the internal domains. 

What should you recommend? 

A. On the DNS servers in contoso.com, configure a reverse lookup zone. On the DNS servers in sales.contoso.com,
configure a conditional forwarder to contoso.com. 

B. On the DNS servers in contoso.com, add a conditional forwarder to the sales.contoso.com zone. On the DNS servers
in sales.contoso.com, add a forwarder to the DNS servers of the company\\'s ISP. 

C. On the DNS servers in contoso.com, create a zone delegation in the contoso.com zone. On the DNS servers in
sales.contoso.com, add a forwarder to the contoso.com DNS servers. 

D. On the DNS servers in contoso.com, configure a conditional forwarder to sales.contoso.com. On the DNS servers in
sales.contoso.com, configure a reverse zone. 

Correct Answer: C 

Scenario: The client computers in sales.contoso.com will use the sales.contoso.com domain controllers as their DNS
servers. 

 

QUESTION 2

Two modes of operation are available when deploying WDS. 

Which of the following are not included in those modes? (Choose two.) 

A. Deployment 

B. Image Response 

C. Transport 

D. Capture 

Correct Answer: BD 

Reference: https://docs.microsoft.com/en-us/previous-versions/windows/it-pro/windows-
server-2008-R2-and-2008/cc770628(v=ws.10)?redirectedfrom=MSDN 

 

QUESTION 3

You have created a Windows Server 2012 virtual machine (VM) to function as a print server. 

Which of the following utilities should you use to migrate the print queues from a physical print server to a virtual print
server? 
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A. Active Directory Migration Tool (ADMT) 

B. The Print Management console. 

C. IP Address Management (IPAM) 

D. MoveTree.exe. 

E. Windows Server Migration Tools. 

Correct Answer: B 

Reference: https://docs.microsoft.com/en-us/previous-versions/windows/it-pro/windows-
server-2012-r2-and-2012/jj134150(v=ws.11) 

 

QUESTION 4

Your network contains an Active Directory forest. The forest contains two Active Directory domains named contoso.com
and child.contoso.com. The forest functional level is Windows Server 2008. The functional level of both domains is
Windows Server 2008 R2. 

The forest contains three domain controllers. The domain controllers are configured as shown in the following table. 

DC1 and DC2 have the DNS Server server role installed and are authoritative for both contoso.com and
child.contoso.com. 

The child.contoso.com domain contains a server named serverl.child.contoso.com that runs Windows Server 2012. 

You plan to deploy server1.child.contoso.com as a read-only domain controller (RODC). 

You run the adprep.exe /rodcprep command on DC3 and receive the following error message: 
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You need to identify what prevents you from successfully running Adprep /rodcprep on DC3. What should you identify? 

A. The domain functional level of child.contoso.com is set to the wrong level. 

B. DC3 cannot connect to the infrastructure master on DC2. 

C. DC3 cannot connect to the domain naming master on DC1. 

D. The forest functional level is set to the wrong level. 

Correct Answer: B 

Adprep could not contact a replica... 

This problem occurs when the Adprep /rodcprep command tries to contact the infrastructure master for each application
partition in the forest. 

 

QUESTION 5

Your company has a main office. 

The network contains an Active Directory domain named contoso.com. The main office contains a server named
Server1 that runs Windows Server 2012 R2. Server1 has the Remote Access server role installed and is configured to
accept 

incoming SSTP-based VPN connections. 

All client computers run Windows 10. 

The company plans to open a temporary office that will contain a server named Server2 that runs Windows Server 2012
R2 and has the DHCP Server server role installed. The office will also have 50 client computers and an Internet 

connection. 

You need to recommend a solution to provide the users in the temporary office with access to the resources in the main
office. 

What should you recommend? 

More than one answer choice may achieve the goal. Select the BEST answer. 

A. Use the Connection Manager Administration Kit (CMAK) to create a connection package that specifies Server1 as
the target for SSTP-based VPN connections. Manually distribute the CMAK package to each client computer in the
temporary office. 
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B. Install the Remote Access server role on Server2. From Routing and Remote Access on Server2, add a SSTP-based
VPN port. From DHCP on Server2, configure the default gateway server option. 

C. Use the Connection Manager Administration Kit (CMAK) to create a connection package that specifies Server1 as
the target for SSTP-based VPN connections. Use a Group Policy object (GPO) to distribute the CMAK package to each
client computer in the temporary office. 

D. Install the Remote Access server role on Server2. From Routing and Remote Access on Server2, configure a
demand-dial interface. From DHCP on Server2, configure the default gateway server option. 

Correct Answer: C 

SSTP cannot be used for site-to-site VPNs (with Windows Server 2012). You will therefore need to configure the clients
to connect. 
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