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QUESTION 1

You are developing a Microsoft .NET Framework 4 application. You create an Entity Data Model (EDM) by using the
Microsoft ADO.NET Entity Data Model Designer (Entity Designer). The EDM contains a complex type. 

You need to map a stored procedure to the complex type by using the Entity Designer. 

What should you do? 

A. Add an association to the stored procedure. 

B. Add a code generation item that has the name of the stored procedure. 

C. Add a function import for the stored procedure. 

D. Add an entity that mirrors the properties of the complex type. 

Correct Answer: C 

 

QUESTION 2

You use Microsoft Visual Studio 2010 and Microsoft .NET Framework 4 to develop an application that uses the Entity
Framework. You create the following Entity Data Model. 

You write the following code. (Line numbers are included for reference only.) 

01using (var context = new AdventureWorksLTEntities()) 

02{ 

03Customer cust = context.Customers.First(); 

04cust.CompanyName = "Contoso"; 

05int count = 0; 

07} 
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The changes to the cust entity must be saved. If an exception is thrown, the application must retry the save 3 times. You
need to add a code segment to meet the requirements. Which code segment should you insert at line 06? 

A. while (count++ 

B. while (cust.EntityState == EntityState.Modified ){try{context.SaveChanges();}catch (Exception){if (count++ > 2
andand context.Connection.State == ConnectionState.Broken){throw new Exception();}}} 

C. while (true){context.SavingChanges += delegate(System.Object o, System.EventArgs e){if (count+ + > 2){throw new
Exception();}context.SaveChanges();};} 

D. while (context.ObjectStateManager.GetObjectStateEntry(cust).OriginalValues.IsDBNull(0)){if (count++ >
2){break;}context.SaveChanges();} 

Correct Answer: B 

 

QUESTION 3

You use Microsoft Visual Studio 2010 and Microsoft .NET Framework 4 to create an application. The application
connects to a Microsoft SQL Server database. The application uses a DataTable named OrderDetailTable that has the
following columns: 

ID OrderID ProductID Quantity LineTotal 

Some records contain a null value in the LineTotal field and 0 in the Quantity field. You write the following code
segment. (Line numbers are included for reference only.) 

01DataColumn column = new DataColumn("UnitPrice", typeof(double)); 03OrderDetailTable.Columns.Add(column); 

You need to add a calculated DataColumn named UnitPrice to the OrderDetailTable object. You also need to ensure
that UnitPrice is set to 0 when it cannot be calculated. Which code segment should you insert at line 02? 

A. column.Expression = "LineTotal/Quantity"; 

B. column.Expression = "LineTotal/ISNULL(Quantity, 1)"; 

C. column.Expression = "if(Quantity > 0, LineTotal/Quantity, 0)"; 

D. column.Expression = "iif(Quantity > 0, LineTotal/Quantity, 0)"; 

Correct Answer: D 

IIF ( boolean_expression, true_value, false_value ) 

 

QUESTION 4

The entity data model must be configured to provide a way to call the sp_FindObsolete stored procedure. The returned
data must implement the Descendants property. 

In Visual Studio 2010, you open the Add Function Import dialog box from the EDMX diagram and enter the information
shown in the following graphic. 
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You need to complete the configuration in the dialog box. 

What should you do? 

A. In the Returns a Collection Of area, click Scalars and then, in the Scalars list, click Int32. 

B. In the Returns a Collection Of area, click Scalars and then, in the Scalars list, click String. 

C. Click the Get Column Information button, click Create New Complex Type and then, in the Complex box, enter Parts. 

D. In the Returns a Collection Of area, click Entities and then, in the Entities list, click Component. 

Correct Answer: D 

 

QUESTION 5

You use Microsoft Visual Studio 2010 and Microsoft .NET Framework 4 to create an application. You use a
TableAdapter object to load a DataTable object. The DataTable object is used as the data source for a GridView control
to display a 

table of customer information on a Web page. 

You need to ensure that the application meets the following requirements: 

Load only new customer records each time the page refreshes. 
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Preserve existing customer records. 

What should you do? 

A. Set the ClearBeforeFill property of the TableAdapter to false. Use the Fill method of the TableAdapter to load
additional customers. 

B. Set the ClearBeforeFill property of the TableAdapter to false. Use the GetData method of the TableAdapter to create
a new DataTable. 

C. Set the ClearBeforeFill property of the TableAdapter to true. Use the Fill method of the TableAdapter to load
additional customers. 

D. Set the ClearBeforeFill property of the TableAdapter to true. Use the GetData method of the TableAdapter to create a
new DataTable. 

Correct Answer: A 

TableAdapter.Fill Populates the TableAdapter\\'s associated data table with the results of the TableAdapter\\'s SELECT
command. TableAdapter.Update Sends changes back to the database. For more information, see How to: 

Update Data Using a TableAdapter. 

TableAdapter.GetData Returns a new DataTable filled with data. TableAdapter.Insert Creates a new row in the data
table. For more information, see How to: Add Rows to a DataTable. 

TableAdapter.ClearBeforeFill Determines whether a data table is emptied before you call one of the Fill methods. 

Table Adapter Overview 

(http://msdn.microsoft.com/en-us/library/bz9tthwx(v=vs.80).aspx) 
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