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QUESTION 1

Once the model has been generated, you must verify its validity by examining the performance indicators: 

Note: There are 2 correct answers to this question. 

A. The predictive power allows you to evaluate the explanatory power of the model, that is, its capacity to explain the
target variable when applied to the training dataset. A perfect model possesses a predictive power of 1 and a completely
random model possesses a predictive power of 0. No minimum threshold is required for the predictive power of a model.
This depends upon the context of your work, that is, your domain of application, the nature of your data and your
business issue. 26 P U B L I C Automated Analytics User Guides and Scenarios Modeling Concepts In some cases, a
model with a predictive power as low as 0.1 may allow realization of a profit of several thousands dollars. In all cases, a
positive predictive power indicates that the model generated will perform better than a random model. 

B. The prediction confidence defines the degree of robustness of the model, that is, its capacity to achieve the same
explanatory power when applied to a new dataset. In other words, the degree of robustness corresponds to the
predictive power of the model when applied to an application dataset. A model with a prediction confidence inferior to
0.95 must be considered with caution. The performance of such a model is very likely to vary between the training
dataset and the application datasets. 

C. The environment variable definition is using the POSIX standard shell sh semantic, which first defines the variable,
then exports it. To guarantee a proper functioning, The environment variable definition is using the POSIX standard
shell shsemantic, which first defines the variable, then exports it. To guarantee a proper functioning, 

Correct Answer: AB 

 

QUESTION 2

To help you validate the description when using the Analyze option, you can display the first hundred lines of your
dataset. 

Note: There are 4 correct answers to this question. 

A. Click the button View Data. A new window opens displaying the dataset top lines. 

B. In the field First Row Index, enter the number of the first row you want to display. 

C. In the field Last Row Index, enter the number of the last row you want to display. 

D. Click the Refresh button to see the selected rows. 

E. Set this group as the group owner of the tmp directory. This should be done if the application has been set up with a
user account that has this group set as its primary group 

Correct Answer: ABCD 

 

QUESTION 3

For formats are supported for the Date column: Note: There are 4 correct answers to this question. 

A. datetime (ISO format: yyyy-mm-dd hh:mm )which has an hour-precision. 
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B. date (ISO format: yyyy-mm-dd) which has a day-precision. 

C. Number(number, for example "seconds") 

D. Java Runtime Environment installed on the client machine to connect to the server. 

Correct Answer: ABCD 

 

QUESTION 4

The term model carries many different meanings depending on its field of application. In data mining, a model describes
and explains the relationships that exist between input data (one or more target variablest allows one to predict and
explain phenomena, or to describe them. To quote George E.P. Box, "All Models Are Wrong But Some Are Useful" from
"Robustness is the Strategy of Scientific Model Building" in Robustness in Statistics. Eds., R.L. Launer and G.N.
Wilkinson, 1979, Academic Press. A model that has satisfactory performance is one that possesses both: 

Note: There are 2 correct answers to this question. 

A. High explanatory power, that is, sufficient capacity to explain the target variable. This explanatory power is indicated
by the predictive power of the model. 

B. High robustness, that is, sufficient capacity to repeat the same performance on new datasets containing observations
of a similar nature to the training dataset. This explanatory power is indicated by the prediction confidence . 

C. Both of these ports must be accessible from the client machine. For example, network firewalls should allow
communication on these ports between client machine and the servers. 

Correct Answer: AB 

 

QUESTION 5

Depending on the type of the target, the model graph plot allows you to: 

Note: There are 3 correct answers to this question. 

A. View the realizable profit that pertains to your business issue using the model generated when the target is nominal. 

B. Compare the performance of the model generated with that of a random type model and that of a hypothetical perfect
model when the target is nominal. 

C. A web server such as Apache Web Server or Windows Internet Information Services (IIS). 

D. Compare the predicted value to the actual value when the target is continuous . 

Correct Answer: ABD 
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