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QUESTION 1

You are cleaning up sandbox environments for a company. 

The company requires data to be cleared from the environments each time an extension is published. 

You need to configure the launch.json file. 

Which schemaUpdateMode property should you set? 

A. ForceUpgrade 

B. ForceSync 

C. Synchronize 

D. Recreate 

Correct Answer: D 

In the context of cleaning up sandbox environments for a company where data needs to be cleared each time an
extension is published, the schemaUpdateMode property in the launch.json file should be set to Recreate (D). Setting
this property to Recreate ensures that every time the extension is published, the existing tables and data are dropped,
and then the tables are recreated based on the current extension\\'s schema. This mode is particularly useful in
development and testing environments where you need a clean slate for testing each version of the extension without
the remnants of previous data affecting the outcomes. It\\'s important to use this setting cautiously, as it results in the
loss of all existing data in the tables defined by the extension, which is suitable for a sandbox environment but not for
production environments. 

 

QUESTION 2

You need to call the Issue API action from the mobile application. 

Which action should you use? 

A. POST /issues(88122e0e-5796-ec11-bb87-000d3a392eb5)/Microsoft.NAV.copy 

B. PATCH /issues(88122e0e-5796-ec11-bb87-000d3a392eb5)/Microsoft.NAV.Copy 

C. POST /issues(88122e0e-5796-ec11-bb87-000d3a392eb5)/Copy 

D. POST /issues(88122e0e-5796-ec11-bb87-000d3a392eb5)/copy 

E. POST /issues(88122e0e-5796-ec11-bb87-000d3a392eb5)/Microsoft.NAV.Copy 

Correct Answer: E 

Use the POST action. 

Use Microsoft.NAV in the URL. 

End the URL with Copy, not copy. 
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Scenario: The IT department creates a custom API for exposing the custom Issue table. The API provides an action for
copying an issue to a new table. The action is defined as follows: 

Contoso, Ltd. must create an API in Business Central to expose item details to the mobile application. 

The API must have the lowest possible impact on the production environment when used during working hours. 

The API must only support Get operations. 

Reference: 

https://businesscentralgeek.com/what-are-bound-actions-in-business-central-apis 

 

QUESTION 3

DRAG DROP 

A company is examining Connect apps and Add-on apps for use with Business Central. You need to describe the
development language requirements for Connect apps and Add- on apps. 

How should you describe the app language requirements? To answer, move the appropriate app types to the correct
descriptions. You may use each app type once, more than once, or not at all. You may need to move the split bar
between panes or scroll to view content. 

NOTE: Each correct selection is worth one point. 

Select and Place: 

Correct Answer: 

Developed by using any coding language: Connect app Developed by using AL language in Visual Studio Code: Add-on
app 

In Microsoft Dynamics 365 Business Central, there are distinct types of applications that can be developed: Connect
apps and Add-on apps. Each has its own development language requirements: 

Connect apps: 
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Add-on apps: 

The language and environment used for developing these apps are key differentiators between Connect apps and Add-
on apps. 

 

QUESTION 4

You create a page with the PageType property set to RoleCenter. 

You navigate through the different sections of the page. 

You need to add functionalities to the page. 

What should you do? 

A. Define actions in the area (reporting) before actions in the area (creation). 

B. Define the navigation menu in the area(processing). 

C. Define the navigation bar in the area (embedding). 

D. Add a source table on the Role Center page. 

Correct Answer: A 

When creating a page with the PageType property set to RoleCenter in Microsoft Dynamics 365 Business Central, it\\'s
essential to organize the functionalities and actions in a manner that enhances user experience and efficiency. The best
practice is to define actions in the area (reporting) before actions in the area (creation) (A). This organization allows
users to access reporting and analytical features quickly, which are commonly used in Role Centers for overview and
insight purposes, before moving on to creation or transactional tasks. This logical flow aligns with typical user workflows,
where analysis and review precede the creation of new records or transactions. The other options, such as defining the
navigation menu in the area(processing) (B), defining the navigation bar in the area (embedding) (C), or adding a source
table on the Role Center page (D), do not directly address the need to add functionalities to the Role Center page in a
user- friendly manner. 

 

QUESTION 5

HOTSPOT 

You have the following XML file sample for the Items list: 
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You plan to create the next XML file by using an XMLport object. You need to complete the code segment to export the
file in the required format How should you complete the code segment? To answer, select the appropriate options in the
answer area. 

Hot Area: 
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Correct Answer: 
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